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Emma is spending the summer with her Scottish cousins—who are wonderful material for her attempt to win
the School Prize for most interesting holiday diary. The cousins, lofty Andy, reserved Fiona, and fierce
Roddy, are experimenting with their grandfather's dilapidated old mini-submarine to see if they can find a
monster in the family loch.

Emma Tupper's Diary is a sometimes terrifying, sometimes broadly hilarious adventure novel in the spirit of
From the Mixed-up Files of Mrs. Basil E. Frankweiler and I Capture the Castle.

Praise for Emma Tupper's Diary:

"Fish out of water Emma must spend the summer in Scotland with cousins she’s never met. They’re
somewhat older and get along fine with minimal adult supervision. Even when they plot to take an old
submarine out on the nearby loch for a spin, adding a Nessy-like monster head to the top for fun, there’s no
one around to urge caution. It’s the sort of family where everyone is whip-smart, conversations are fast and
fascinating, and statements of fact are rarely truthful. All of which makes for one extremely suspenseful and
surprisingly thought-provoking adventure."—Gwenyth Swain (author of Chig and the Second Spread)

"One of my favorite childhood books. . . . Its themes and plot have come around again, and a smart
production company should scoop it up for a film adaptation."—Atomic Librarian

"An enthralling book, with fascinating characters, told with humor and wit, and with a story that just might,
barely, be possible."—Book Loons

"Comedy of manners? Ecological allegory? Adventure? Farce?"—Kirkus Reviews

Praise for Peter Dickinson's children's books:

"One of the real masters of children's literature."—Philip Pullman

"Peter Dickinson is a national treasure."—The Guardian

"Magnificent. Peter Dickinson is the past-master story-teller of our day."—The Times Literary Supplement

Peter Dickinson is the author of over fifty books including Eva, Earth and Air, The Dancing Bear, and the
Michael L. Printz honor book The Ropemaker. He has twice received the Crime Writers' Association's Gold
Dagger as well as the Guardian Award and Whitbread Prize. He lives in England and is married to the
novelist Robin McKinley.
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From reader reviews:

Glenn Pryor:

Nowadays reading books be a little more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading habit give
you lot of advantages. Associate programs you got of course the knowledge even the information inside the
book this improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of
publication you read, if you want have more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you
want truly feel happy read one having theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. Often the Emma
Tupper's Diary is kind of e-book which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Arturo Lamb:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of exercise that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book
so. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new data. When
you read a publication you will get new information mainly because book is one of a number of ways to
share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, studying a book will make a person more imaginative.
When you reading through a book especially fictional works book the author will bring one to imagine the
story how the people do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other people. When you read
this Emma Tupper's Diary, you could tells your family, friends as well as soon about yours book. Your
knowledge can inspire the mediocre, make them reading a guide.

Francis King:

The reason why? Because this Emma Tupper's Diary is an unordinary book that the inside of the guide
waiting for you to snap that but latter it will shock you with the secret it inside. Reading this book beside it
was fantastic author who write the book in such amazing way makes the content inside of easier to
understand, entertaining means but still convey the meaning thoroughly. So , it is good for you because of
not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This book will give you a lot of benefits than
the other book have got such as help improving your talent and your critical thinking method. So , still want
to hold off having that book? If I were you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Jo Jordan:

The book untitled Emma Tupper's Diary contain a lot of information on this. The writer explains the woman
idea with easy approach. The language is very clear and understandable all the people, so do not worry, you
can easy to read that. The book was compiled by famous author. The author will bring you in the new era of
literary works. It is possible to read this book because you can please read on your smart phone, or program,
so you can read the book inside anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you
can start their official web-site and order it. Have a nice study.
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